
12/01/22

Year 5/6 English 
Homework 



Activity 1: 
Interview 
questions

• Do you know someone who 
came to England from the 
Caribbean on the Windrush or 
just after that, in the early 50s 
or 60s?

• Choose the questions that 
most interest you from each of 
the subjects in the list below 
and add your own questions to 
interview them. Record their 
answers in your homework 
book. 

• When did you arrive in 
England? 

• Who travelled with you? Did 
you leave someone you loved 
behind? 

• Why did you move here? How 
did you feel before coming here? 

• How did you feel when you 
arrived? 

• Where did you live when you 
first arrived? 

• What was the most difficult 
thing for you about moving to 
England?

• What did you bring with you 
when you moved here



Spelling – Year 5- 6



Word of the week: 

Find the definition and use this word in 
a complex sentence

Ostentatious


